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Terms and Conditions 

Last updated: February 24, 2020 

Please read these Terms and Conditions (“Terms”, “Terms and Conditions”) carefully 
before use of websites www.k-linkonline.com or www.k-linkindo.com . 

 

1. DISCLAIMER 

1.1 The information and material on this website are provided on an “as is” and “as 
available” basis and no warranty is deemed to be made by K-LINK 
INTERNATIONAL Sdn. Bhd. as to the accuracy, adequacy, completeness or 
reasonableness of the information and materials contained in or accessed through 
this website and expressly disclaims liability for any errors in, or omissions errors in, 
or omissions from, such information and materials. No warranty of any kind, 
implied, express (including but not limited to, warranties of title, merchantability, 
satisfactory quality, non-infringement of third-party intellectual property rights, 
fitness for a particular purpose), is given in conjunction with such information and 
materials, or this website in general. 

1.2 The information and materials provided on this website are for informational 
purposes only and are not to be considered as complete descriptions of the products 
and services described within. 

1.3 No responsibility or liability shall be accepted by K-LINK INTERNATIONAL Sdn. 
Bhd. for the content/materials/information provided on the websites linked to this 
website (which are not maintained by K-LINK INTERNATIONAL Sdn. Bhd. or 
endorsed by the K-LINK INTERNATIONAL Sdn. Bhd.). 

 

2. PROHIBITIONS  

 The materials and information on this website belong to K-LINK INTERNATIONAL 
Sdn. Bhd. and may not be posted, copied, distributed, uploaded or reproduced in any 
manner whatsoever. You may not insert a hyperlink to this website or any part 
thereof on any other website or “mirror” or frame this website, any part thereof or 
any information or materials in this website on any other server or web-site. 
 
 

3. INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY  

K-LINK INTERNATIONAL Sdn. Bhd. is the owner and proprietor of all the marks, 
whether service or trademarks, logos on this website of which, as such, they may not 
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be published, transmitted, reproduced, performed, displayed, adapted, distributed, 
stored, broadcast, altered, stored, hyperlinked or otherwise used in whole or in part 
in any manner without the express prior written consent of the K-LINK 
INTERNATIONAL Sdn. Bhd.. Any pictures or images or video materials or audio 
materials displayed on this website belong to K-LINK INTERNATIONAL Sdn. Bhd. 
or are displayed by K-LINK INTERNATIONAL Sdn. Bhd. with the permission of the 
owners of these pictures or images or video materials or audio materials. The use of 
these pictures or images or video materials or audio materials is strictly prohibited. 

 

4. LIMITATION OF LIABILITY 

No warranties are deemed to be made by K-LINK INTERNATIONAL Sdn. Bhd. with 
regard to accuracy and correctness of the information or materials on this website 
and K-LINK INTERNATIONAL Sdn. Bhd. shall not be liable to any third party 
accessing this website from whatever location, for any direct, indirect or 
consequential damages which may occur due to the use or inability to gain access to 
the information or materials on this website, or reliance on any such information or 
materials provided on this website even if the K-LINK INTERNATIONAL Sdn. Bhd. 
or a representative of the K-LINK INTERNATIONAL Sdn. Bhd. has been notified of 
this possibility of incurring such damages. 

Likewise, no liability or responsibility shall be borne by K-LINK INTERNATIONAL 
Sdn. Bhd. for any damages suffered as a result of any computer viruses downloaded 
into any computer or internet access device as a consequence of downloading any 
materials, images or data from this website or from using and accessing this website. 

 

5. TERMINATION 

K-LINK INTERNATIONAL Sdn. Bhd. may terminate or suspend your access to our 
Service immediately, without prior notice for any reason whatsoever, including 
without limitation if you breach the Terms. All provisions of the Terms shall survive 
termination, including, without limitation, ownership provisions, warranty 
disclaimers, indemnity and limitations of liability.  

 


